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The University of Washington-Korea Studies Program, in collaboration with Rowman & Littlefield
Publishers, is proud to publish the Journal of Korean Studies. In 1979 Dr. James Palais (PhD Harvard 1968),
former UW professor of Korean History edited and published the first volume of the Journal of Korean
Studies. For thirteen years it was a leading academic forum for innovative, in-depth research on Korea. In
2004 former editors Gi-Wook Shin and John Duncan revived this outstanding publication at Stanford
University. In August 2008 editorial responsibility transferred back to the University of Washington. With
the editorial guidance of Clark Sorensen and Donald Baker, the Journal of Korean Studies (JKS) continues to
be dedicated to publishing outstanding articles, from all disciplines, on a broad range of historical and
contemporary topics concerning Korea. In addition the JKS publishes reviews of the latest Korea-related
books.

To subscribe to the Journal of Korean Studies or order print back issues, please click here.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Williams:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question because just their
can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on
kindergarten until university need this The Journal of Korean Studies, Volume 13, Number 1 (Fall 2008) to
read.

Jack Lumpkin:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Journal of Korean
Studies, Volume 13, Number 1 (Fall 2008) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's observe.

Frank Johnson:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific The Journal of Korean Studies, Volume 13, Number
1 (Fall 2008) can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you have factor
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by
knowing more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have
The Journal of Korean Studies, Volume 13, Number 1 (Fall 2008).

Jeff Brown:

You may get this The Journal of Korean Studies, Volume 13, Number 1 (Fall 2008) by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this
book through e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your
reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose
right ways for you.
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