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When the editors of Chûô kôron, Japan's leading liberal magazine, sent the prizewinning young novelist
Ishikawa Tatsuzô to war-ravaged China in early 1938, they knew the independent-minded writer would
produce a work wholly different from the lyrical and sanitized war reports then in circulation. They could not
predict, however, that Ishikawa would write an unsettling novella so grimly realistic it would promptly be
banned and lead to the author’s conviction on charges of "disturbing peace and order." Decades later,
Soldiers Alive remains a deeply disturbing and eye-opening account of the Japanese march on Nanking and
its aftermath. In its unforgettable depiction of an ostensibly altruistic war’s devastating effects on the soldiers
who fought it and the civilians they presumed to "liberate," Ishikawa’s work retains its power to shock,
inform, and provoke.
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From reader reviews:

Victor Banister:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons
or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write with their book. One of them
is this Soldiers Alive.

Susan Jun:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the whole day to
reading a guide. The book Soldiers Alive it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended
this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to bring this book
you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book through your smart phone. The
price is not to fund but this book provides high quality.

Teresa Thomas:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its protect may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Soldiers Alive why because the amazing cover that make you
consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Thomas Daniels:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel,
comics, and also soon. The Soldiers Alive offer you a new experience in reading a book.
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