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“If you love him, you will do it.”

These vague words had haunted reporter Adele Lumas for nearly as long as she could remember, in fractured
dreams where she was pursued by an unknown but threatening entity. Thanks to various mental ailments, her
waking life isn’t that much better. She gulps handfuls of pills just to play the part of normal, even though she
knows deep down that’s one thing she will never be.

Things take a turn for the worse when a serial killer lands in their sleepy burg, targeting their most
vulnerable citizens – the children. That’s when Adele begins to have different dreams, where she is no longer
prey, but the hunter. She witnesses every single one before they happen, which sends her right to the brink of
what she can bear.

Just about this time, a beautiful man enters her life and makes her feel anything but odd or weird. He makes
her feel beautiful, desired… loved. It is a connection she cannot explain, as though she and this stranger are
tied together by an unbreakable cord. Yet the closer they get, the more danger surrounds her life, targeting
those closest to her.

As the mystery unravels, she fears that she has met this man before, in another life, where they are bound
together through the ages by the curse of blood. Now only she can kill him, or risk losing every single human
she’s grown to love.

“My Immortal” is a paranormal romance that blends vampire lore with reincarnation, which explores the
idea of soul mates and sacrifice. Written by author/screenwriter Ginger Voight, it blends her two loves of the
romance and horror genres into a sensual, spooky suspense.

Adult content intended for readers 18+.
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From reader reviews:

Brad Black:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book called My Immortal?
Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different
opinion?

Raymond Lee:

The publication with title My Immortal posesses a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot
of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new information the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of
the world. This book will bring you in new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on the smart
phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Pamela Acuna:

My Immortal can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away
because this reserve has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in language, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to get
every word into joy arrangement in writing My Immortal nevertheless doesn't forget the main position,
giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource details that maybe you can be among it. This
great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

Doris Blair:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal or real their
interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this My Immortal can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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