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Hermosamente escrita, emocionalmente profunda, la historia de Jean-Michel Basquiat y Suzanne
Mallouk, amantes unidos por el imparable poder de la adicción y del arte, la obsesión y el amor.

Un retrato que revela a una mujer apasionada, complicada, brillante y vital para la vida de Basquiat.

Suzanne lleva escondida heroína en el cabello para que no puedan encontrarla ni drogadictos ni policías.
Basquiat vive en las bancas de Washington Square Park, con sus crayones y sus otras pocas pertenencias
guardadas en una bolsa de plástico. Una vez que se conocen en un oscuro y maloliente bar llamado Night
Birds, se vuelven inseparables. Juntos viven un Nueva York glamoroso, artístico, musical, violento,
drogadicto y convulso.

La crítica ha opinado:

"Una hermosa y poética memoria# Basquiat sabía la manera en que la posteridad lo iba a juzgar. La viuda
Basquiat debería ser parte de ese criterio." - The Herald

"Una historia brillante de la relación entre Basquiat y su musa y amante# Un libro emocionante que te deja
con un enorme nudo en la garganta." - Independent on Sunday

"Con cortos y episódicos capítulos, Clement nos ofrece una mirada al interior de la vida de un artista
brillante, así como de un mundo caótico que lo consumió. Una biografía poética e inquietante de un talentoso
pero imperfecto artista." - Kirkus Reviews
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From reader reviews:

Gavin Wilkins:

The book La viuda Basquiat (Spanish Edition) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why must we leave a very important thing like a book La viuda
Basquiat (Spanish Edition)? A few of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can
give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or
details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book La viuda
Basquiat (Spanish Edition) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can
search the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Tonia Lee:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love La viuda Basquiat (Spanish Edition),
you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout
type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Joyce Shryock:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this La viuda Basquiat (Spanish Edition) e-
book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone
who else read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for
eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty La viuda Basquiat (Spanish Edition) as good
book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't assess book
by its protect, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying
sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Earl Parker:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of book La viuda
Basquiat (Spanish Edition). Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add
your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book.
It can bring you from one location to other place.
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